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P G C PS Keith Stewart, Director | keith.stewart@pgcps.org
13300 0ld Marlboro Pike | Upper Marlboro, MD 20772 | 301-952-6560

REVISED CONTRACT AMENDMENT NO. 3

June 27, 2022

Singer Ashland Equipment Buyer: Donna Parks/DF

1324 Brass Mill Road Telephone: 301.952.6567
Belcamp, MD 21017 Fax: 301.952.6605

Tel No.: 410.273.1856 Email: donna.parks@pgcps.org

Contact: Todd Schaeffer
Email: tschaeffer@singerequipment.com

Subject: IFB: 028-19 Kitchen Serving Line Replacement (Department of Food & Nutrition
This Contract Amendment (the "Contract Amendment") is made by the Board of Education of Prince George’s County
and Singer Ashland Equipment to the Agreement dated May 17, 2019 the "Agreement").
1. The purpose of the Contract Amendment is to:
A. Incorporate mandatory Covid-19 vaccination verification and weekly Covid-19 testing requirements for
contractors, vendors, volunteers, interns, and any other non-PGCPS employee who is doing any work or

providing services on-site at a PGCPS office or school. See Attachment A for Covid-19 mandatory requirements.

B. The Agreement exercise renewal option and increase price driven by raw materials and surcharges inbound freight
cost from the signature date through April 30 2023.

2. Except as set forth in this Contract Amendment, the Agreement is unaffected and shall continue in full force and
effect in accordance with the terms set forth in the original agreement renewal term.

See Contract Price
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In Witness Whereof, the undersigned agree to be bound by the terms and conditions set forth in this Contract

Amendment to the Contract Award.

ACCEPTED BY:

FOR THE FIRM:

FOR THE BOARD OF EDUCATION:

g{{ekgéﬁéﬁﬁﬁ EDT) \]un 28, 2022 keith.stewart@pgcps.org keith.stewart@pgcps.org (Jun 29, 2022 13:22 EDT) Jun 29, 2022
SIGNATURE DATE SIGNATURE DATE
NAME NAME:

GM-VP Director, Purchasing & Supply Services

TITLE TITLE

Singer Ashland

FIRM

FOR THE BOARD OF EDUCATION
OF PRINCE GEORGE’S COUNTY
UPPER MARLBORO, MARYLAND 20772
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Singer Ashland Equipment IFB: 028-19

Contract Amendment No. 3
ATTACHMENT A

MANDATORY COVID 19: VACCINE AND TESTING REQUIRMENTS
AND ON-SITE PROGRAMMING BY NON-PGCPS EMPLOYEES

WHEREAS, the Parties desire to incorporate the terms of policy into the aforementioned Contract in order to
document expectations of Respondent/VVendor/Contractor/Partner’s staff regarding Covid-19 vaccination and
testing mandates for PGCPS.

NOW THEREFORE, THIS CONTRACT AMENDMENT WITNESSETH THAT, in consideration of the
mutual promises and covenants herein contained and for other good and valuable consideration, the receipt and
sufficiency of which are hereby acknowledged, the parties agree as follows:

A. COVID-19: VACCINE AND TESTING REQUIREMENTS AND ON-SITE PROGRAMMING BY

NON-PGCPS EMPLOYEES

Effective September 13, 2021, or at any time during the term of this Contract in which services commence by
any intern, volunteer, vendor, contractor or employee of Partner (referred to herein as “Partner’s staff”),
PGCPS will require proof of vaccination against Covid-19 or weekly proof of a negative Covid-19 test [with
results obtained within seventy-two (72) hours] each Monday for unvaccinated Partner’s staff who are
providing services on-site at a PGCPS facility.

1. Unless otherwise stated and to the extent possible, Partner’s services shall be rendered virtually during the
term of this Contract or until such time that PGCPS authorizes in-person services by Partner.

2. In the event Partner’s services must be provided at a PGCPS site (not virtually):

a.

Partner’s staff shall be required to provide confirmation of vaccination to the designated PGCPS
Point of Contact (i.e. principal/designee or responsible department/office representative) who is
responsible for ensuring that the scope of services are completed.

Partner’s staff shall be required to submit a list or other documentation of all Partner’s staff who are
vaccinated prior to the initiation of services. During the term of the Contract, Partner shall be
responsible for supplementing this list for any new Partner staff assigned to provide services under
this Contract prior to the Partner’s staff’s start date of services.

Unvaccinated, staff providing services at a PGCPS site must present proof of a negative Covid-19 test
taken within seventy-two (72) hours to the designated PGCPS Point of Contact (i.e.
principal/designee or responsible department/office representative) who is responsible for ensuring
that the scope of services are completed. Contractor shall be responsible for providing results from
pharmacies and labs that are accredited to administer Covid-19 testing. Results obtained from home
Covid-19 testing kits will not be accepted and shall not meet the requirements of this Contract.
Partner shall be required to submit a list or other documentation of all Partner’s staff who tested
negative by the close of business each Monday. If Monday is a holiday, then the list or other
documentation must be submitted on the next day in which schools are open by close of business.
This requirement shall continue each week during the term of this Contract.

PGCPS will not be responsible for testing Partner’s staff. Failure to provide proof of negative results
will bar Partner’s staff from providing in-person services at a PGCPS site until such time as the
information is presented.



Page 4
Singer Ashland Equipment IFB: 028-19
Contract Amendment No. 3

3. Partner shall inform its PGCPS Point of Contact via phone call or email immediately upon being
informed that any of its staff are unavailable to provide onsite services for any day(s) in which they are
unable to present a negative Covid-19 test.

4. In the event a non-PGCPS staff tests positive for Covid-19, Partner shall inform the PGCPS Point of
Contact immediately but no later than 24 hours after receiving notification of a positive Covid-19 test
from the non-PGCPS employee.

B. The Parties agree that all other terms and conditions of the Agreement shall remain in full force and effect and
shall only be amended in writing, signed by both parties.
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Singer Ashland Equipment

IFB: 028-19

Amendment No. 3

Contract Price

ITEM ESTIMATED Proposed Brand and Model CURRENT PRICING |, b cenTAGE] UMECOSt | 1ol cost (prIOR) | o2 Cost
NUMBER ITEM DESCRIPTION ANNUAL UOM Number (Reflecting Delfiield INCREASE (Overtime ( Regular Rate) (Current
QUANTITIES PRIOR UNIT COST Increases) Rate) Pricing)
(Regular Rate)
Delfield Model SH-3-NU or approved equal, 3 Food Wells. Shelleysteel Hot Brand
1 Food Serving Counter, 50” long, 36” high, 3-food wells Without Under Storage 3 Ea Delfield
as specified herein. ’ Model # SH-3-
NIT - $6,848.00 $10,614.00 55% No Bid $20,544.00 $31,842.00
CP-GLASS FRONT COUNTER PROTECTOR 48.06 INCHES LONG X 18 Brand
INCHES WIDE. FIRST TIER S/S TOP AND FIXED GLASS FRONT. (1) LI- Delfied
2 50 - INCANDESCENT LIGHT ON FIRST TIER. (1) M-50 - RADIANT 3 Ea. Model #G-50 Price included in |PTice included inno. 1 $No Bid #VALUE!
HEAT LAMP ON FIRST TIER AS SPECIFIED HEREIN o 1
Delfield Model SH-4-NU or approved equal, 4 Food Wells. Shelleysteel Hot Brand Delfield
3 Food Serving Counter, 60” long, 36” high, 4-food wells Without Under Storage 3 Ea Model #
as specified herein. )
_SH-4-NU $7,652.00 $11,860.00 55% $No Bid $22,956.00 $35,580.00
CP-GLASS FRONT COUNTER PROTECTOR 58.06 INCHES LONG X 18 q
INCHES WIDE. FIRST TIER S/S TOP AND FIXED GLASS FRONT. (1) LI- Delfield Bran
4 60 - INCANDESCENT LIGHT ON FIRST TIER. (1) M-60 - RADIANT 3 Ea |- Price included in no. 3 $No Bid #VALUE!
HEAT LAMP ON FIRST TIER AS SPECIFIED HEREIN Model # __ G- Price included in
60 no. 3
Delfield Model SH-5-NU or approved equal, 5 Food Wells. Shelleysteel Hot Brand
5 Food Serving Counter, 74” long, 36 high, 5-food wells Without Under Storage 3 Ea __Delfield
as specified herein. ’ Model # SH-5-
NIJ - $8,855.00 $13,725.00 55% $No Bid $26,565.00 $41,175.00
CP-GLASS FRONT COUNTER PROTECTOR 72.06 INCHES LONG X 18 q
INCHES WIDE. FIRST TIER S/S TOP AND FIXED GLASS FRONT. (1) LI- Delfield Bran
6 74 - INCANDESCENT LIGHT ON FIRST TIER. (1) M-74 - RADIANT 3 Ea | M Price included in no. 5 No Bid #VALUE!
HEAT LAMP ON FIRST TIER AS SPECIFIED HEREIN Model # _G- Price included in
74 no. 5
Delfield Model SCFT-50-NU or approved equal. SHELLEYSTEEL 50" LONG, Brand
7 36 " HIGH MOBILE FROST TOP SERVING COUNTER WITHOUT 3 Fa Delfield
UNDERSTORAGE AS SPECIFIED HEREIN ’ Model # SCFT-50-
NI $5,209.00 $8,074.00 55% No Bid $15,627.00 $24,222.00
CP-TWO-TIER DISPLAY. H-50 TWO-TIER DISPLAY 48.06 INCHES Brand
LONG X 18 INCHES WIDE. FIRST TIER GLASS TOP, SECOND TIER ran
g |GLASS TOP, ADJUSTABLE SNEESE GUEARD FRONT, L-50 3 Fa | -Pelfield
FLOURESCENT LIGHT ON FIRST AND SECOND TIER AS SPECIFIED Model # __H- Price included in
HEREIN 50 no. 7 Price included in no. 7 No Bid #VALUE!
Delfield Model SCFT-60-NU. SHELLEYSTEEL 60" LONG, 36 " HIGH Brand
9 MOBILE FROST TOP SERVING COUNTER WITHOUT UNDERSTORAGE 3 e Delfield
AS SPECIFIED HEREIN a. Model # SCFT-60-
NU $6,195.00 $9,602.00 55% No Bid $18,585.00 $28,806.00
CP-TWO-TIER DISPLAY. H-60 TWO-TIER DISPLAY 58.06 INCHES Brand
LONG X 18 INCHES WIDE. FIRST TIER GLASS TOP, SECOND TIER Delfield
10  |GLASS TOP, ADJUSTABLE SNEESE GUEARD FRONT, L-60 3 Ea. | — o€
FLOURESCENT LIGHT ON FIRST AND SECOND TIER AS SPECIFIED Model # _H- Price included in
HEREIN 60 no. 9 Price included in no. 9 No Bid #VALUE!
Delfield Model SC-28-NU or approved equal. SHELLEYSTEEL MOBILE brand
11 ALL-PURPOSE COUNTER, 28" LONG, 36" HIGH AS SPECIFIED HEREIN 3 Fa _Delfield
' Model # SC-28-
Ty $1,140.00 $1,767.00 55% No Bid $3,420.00 $5,301.00
Delfield Model SC-36-NU or approved equal. SHELLEYSTEEL MOBILE Brand
0 ALL-PURPOSE COUNTER, 36" LONG, 36" HIGH AS SPECIFIED HEREIN 3 E Delfield
a. - o o~
Model # SC-36-
a $1,245.00 $1,930.00 55% No Bid $3,735.00 $5,790.00
Delfield Model SC-50-NU. SHELLEYSTEEL MOBILE ALL-PURPOSE brand
13 COUNTER, 50" LONG, 36" HIGH AS SPECIFIED HEREIN 3 Fa | -Deffield
’ Model # SC-50- .
T T $1,646.00 $2,551.00 55% No Bid $4,938.00 $7,653.00
Delfield Model SCS-30 or approved equal. MOBLIE CASH COUNTER, 30" Brand
" LONG, 36" HIGH, 120V/60Hz OUTLET WITH 10 AMP BREAKER AS 3 E Delfield
a. -
SPECIFIED HEREIN Model # SCS-
$2,518.00 $3,903.00 55% No Bid $7,554.00 $11,709.00
Delfield Model SCS-36 or approved equal. MOBLIE CASH COUNTER, 36" Brand
15 LONG, 36" HIGH, 120V/60Hz OUTLET WITH 10 AMP BREAKER AS 3 Ea _Delfield
SPECIFIED HEREIN ’ Model # SCS-
16 N $2,697.00 $4,180.00 55% No Bid $8,091.00 $12,540.00
Total $132,015.00
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